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THE EARLE COMPANIES TOP LINE CONSTRUCTION RICHARD T. BARRETT PAVING

CONTRACT B11-17 ENGINEER'S 1800 ROUTE 34 22 FIFTH STREET 400 PROSPECT ST

SUPPLEMENTAL ROAD PROGRAM ESTIMATE WALL, NJ 07719 SOMERVILLE, NJ 08876 TRENTON, NJ 08618

732-308-1112 908-231-7570 609-883-7749

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY AND UNITS PRICE TOTAL ITEM NO. PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
1 SITE CLEARING AND MOBILIZATION 1.0 LUMP SUM $40,000.00 $40,000.00 1 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00
2 TRAFFIC CONTROL 1.0 LUMP SUM $15,000.00 $15,000.00 2 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00
3 SOIL EROSION AND SEDIMENT CONTROL 1.0 LUMP SUM $5,000.00 $5,000.00 3 $110.00 $110.00 $800.00 $800.00
4 2" BITUMINOUS PAVEMENT MILLING 25783.0 SY $3.50 $90,240.50 4 $1.56 $40,221.48 $2.10 $54,144.30
5 2" COMP. HMA 9.5M64 SURF. COURSE 3870.0 TON $70.00 $270,900.00 5 $68.95 $266,836.50 $74.00 $286,380.00
6 4" BITUMINOUS PAVEMENT MILLING 5000.0 SY $4.50 $22,500.00 6 $2.78 $13,900.00 $3.80 $19,000.00
7 4" COMP. HMA12.5M64 SURF. COURSE 1275.0 TON $70.00 $89,250.00 7 $68.35 $87,146.25 $69.00 $87,975.00
8 SAFETY GRATES 3.0 UNIT $500.00 $1,500.00 8 $230.00 $690.00 $300.00 $900.00
9 TYPE 'N' ECO INLET HEADS 3.0 UNIT $400.00 $1,200.00 9 $295.00 $885.00 $300.00 $900.00

10 DISTRESSED PAVEMENT REPLACEMENT 3000.0 SY $28.00 $84,000.00 10 $12.75 $38,250.00 $50.00 $150,000.00
11 DISTRESSED SUBGRADE REPLACEMENT 750.0 CY $35.00 $26,250.00 11 NO BID $0.01 $7.50 $30.00 $22,500.00
12 6"X8"X18" CONC. CURB REPLACEMENT 100.0 LF $35.00 $3,500.00 12 $33.35 $3,335.00 $30.00 $3,000.00
13 INLET REPAIR 1.0 UNIT $750.00 $750.00 13 $950.00 $950.00 $500.00 $500.00
14 BITUMINOUS DRIVEWAY APRON 400.0 SY $25.00 $10,000.00 14 $0.01 $4.00 $30.00 $12,000.00
15 CRACK SEALING 1000.0 LF $3.00 $3,000.00 15 $1.55 $1,550.00 $1.20 $1,200.00
16 CRACK REPAIR 1000.0 LF $10.00 $10,000.00 16 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.20 $1,200.00
17 24" THERMOPLASTIC STOP BAR 60.0 LF $6.00 $360.00 17 $6.30 $378.00 $6.60 $396.00
18 4" EPOXY STRIPING 47400.0 LF $1.00 $47,400.00 18 $0.52 $24,648.00 $0.32 $15,168.00
19 5" TOPSOIL, SEED, FERT., LIME AND MULCH 1500.0 SY $6.00 $9,000.00 19 $8.00 $12,000.00 $6.00 $9,000.00
20 POLICE TRAFFIC DIRECTOR IF AND WHERE DIR. 40.0 HOUR $55.00 $2,200.00 20 $55.00 $2,200.00 $55.00 $2,200.00
21 CONTINGENCY 1.0 LUMP SUM $50,000.00 $50,000.00 21 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
22 FUEL ADJUSTMENT 1.0 LUMP SUM $1,500.00 $1,500.00 22 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00
23 ASPHALT ADJUSTMENT 1.0 LUMP SUM $7,000.00 $7,000.00 23 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID $790,550.50 $584,611.73 $770,263.30
1 SITE CLEARING AND MOBILIZATION 1 LUMP SUM $3,000.00 $3,000.00 1 $2,820.00 $2,820.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
2 TRAFFIC CONTROL 1 LUMP SUM $1,500.00 $1,500.00 2 $0.01 $0.01 $1,000.00 $1,000.00
3 SOIL EROSION AND SEDIMENT CONTROL 1 LUMP SUM $1,000.00 $1,000.00 3 $330.00 $330.00 $800.00 $800.00
4 DOUBLE TYPE E INLET W/SLAB TOP 1 UNIT $7,500.00 $7,500.00 4 $7,400.00 $7,400.00 $5,850.00 $5,850.00
5 3/4"CLEAN CRUSHED STONE 5 CY $35.00 $175.00 5 NO BID $20.80 $104.00 $60.00 $300.00
6 SELECT FILL 20 CY $25.00 $500.00 6 $17.75 $355.00 $57.50 $1,150.00
7 TYPE E INLET 1 UNIT $3,500.00 $3,500.00 7 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00
8 5" TOPSOIL, SEED, FERT., LIME AND MULCH 200 SY $6.00 $1,200.00 8 $8.65 $1,730.00 $9.00 $1,800.00
9 CONTINGENCY 1 UNIT $2,000.00 $2,000.00 9 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00

TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID A $20,375.00 $19,239.01 $19,900.00
1 SITE CLEARING AND MOBILIZATION 1 LUMP SUM $10,000.00 $10,000.00 1 $6,485.00 $6,485.00 $3,400.00 $3,400.00
2 TRAFFIC CONTROL 1 LUMP SUM $2,000.00 $2,000.00 2 $0.01 $0.01 $500.00 $500.00
3 SOIL EROSION AND SEDIMENT CONTROL 1 LUMP SUM $3,000.00 $3,000.00 3 $1,275.00 $1,275.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00
4 DOUBLE TYPE E INLET 1 UNIT $7,500.00 $7,500.00 4 $5,620.00 $5,620.00 $5,850.00 $5,850.00
5 24" RCP CLASS III 125 LF $75.00 $9,375.00 5 $57.00 $7,125.00 $69.20 $8,650.00
6 CONCRETE HEADWALL 1 UNIT $2,000.00 $2,000.00 6 NO BID $3,615.00 $3,615.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00
7 BELGIAN BLOCK CURB 10 UNIT $45.00 $450.00 7 $32.15 $321.50 $50.00 $500.00
8 RIP RAP SCOUR HOLE 5 CY $35.00 $175.00 8 $306.00 $1,530.00 $250.00 $1,250.00
9 3/4"CLEAN CRUSHED STONE 10 CY $35.00 $350.00 9 $20.80 $208.00 $60.00 $600.00

10 SELECT FILL 200 CY $25.00 $5,000.00 10 $16.85 $3,370.00 $42.00 $8,400.00
11 CONCRETE SIDEWALK 44 SF $8.00 $352.00 11 $2.50 $110.00 $20.00 $880.00
12 5" TOPSOIL, SEED, FERT., LIME AND MULCH 160 SY $6.00 $960.00 12 $9.90 $1,584.00 $9.00 $1,440.00
13 LANDSCAPE REPLACEMENT 1 LUMP SUM $4,000.00 $4,000.00 13 $2,700.00 $2,700.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
14 WATERMAIN RELOCATION 1 LUMP SUM $5,000.00 $5,000.00 14 $8,075.00 $8,075.00 $5,800.00 $5,800.00
15 CONTINGENCY 1 LUMP SUM $5,000.00 $5,000.00 15 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID B $55,162.00 $47,018.51 $51,470.00
1 SITE CLEARING AND MOBILIZATION 1 LUMP SUM $2,500.00 $2,500.00 1 $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00
2 TRAFFIC CONTROL 1 LUMP SUM $2,000.00 $2,000.00 2 $635.00 $635.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00
3 RADAR SPEED LIMIT SIGN 2 UNIT $7,500.00 $15,000.00 3 $8,925.00 $17,850.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00
4 THERMOPLASTIC "SLOW" 3 UNIT $500.00 $1,500.00 4 NO BID $78.75 $236.25 $50.00 $150.00
5 TRAFFIC CALMING SIGN 3 UNIT $350.00 $1,050.00 5 $173.25 $519.75 $150.00 $450.00
6 8" THERMOPLASTIC CROSSWALK STRIPING 180 LF $5.00 $900.00 6 $2.10 $378.00 $3.40 $612.00
7 ENDURABLEN OR EQUAL CROSSWALK 540 SF $25.00 $13,500.00 7 $19.40 $10,476.00 $4.50 $2,430.00

TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID C $36,450.00 $32,195.00 $28,442.00
TOTAL BASE BID + ALL ALTERNATE BIDS $902,537.50 $683,064.25 $870,075.30
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