BID SUMMARY SHEET
Prepared By
Van Cleef Engineering Associates
4 AAA Drive, Suite 102, Hamilton, NJ 08691

MUNICIPALITY: HOPEWELL TOWNSHIP DATE: 7/20/11 TIME: 09:00 AM SHEET 10F 2
ARAWAK PAVING BIL-JIM CONSTRUCTION CO., INC. |BLACK ROCK ENTERPRISES, LLC ~ |CONSTRUCTION DATA CO.
CONTRACT B11-07 ENGINEER'S 7503 WEYMOUTH ROAD 577 SOUTH HOPE CHAPEL ROAD  |208 WEST GREYSTONE ROAD 1 OAKBROOK TERRACE, SUITE 510
2010 ROAD MAINTENANCE PROGRAM - VARIOUS ROADS ESTIMATE HAMMONTON, NJ 08037 JACKSON, NJ 08527 OLD BRIDGE, NJ 08857 OAK BROOK TERRACE, IL 60181
609.561.4100, FAX:609.567.4750 |732.928.1040, FAX 732.370.8384 732.656.1089, FAX 732.234.3564 800.872.7878, FAX 866.714.9554
CERTIFIED CHECK OR BID BOND AMOUNT CHK/BOND
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY AND UNITS PRICE TOTAL ITEM NO. PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
1 SITE CLEARING AND MOBILIZATION 1 LUMP SUM $75,000.00 $75,000.00 1 $180,000.00  $180,000.00 $37,000.00 $37,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00
2 TRAFFIC CONTROL 1 LUMP SUM $30,000.00 $30,000.00 2 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00
3 SOIL EROSION AND SEDIMENT CONTROL 1 LUMP SUM $10,000.00 $10,000.00 3 $100.00 $100.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00
4 2" BITUMINOUS PAVEMENT MILLING 29672 sY $3.50 $103,852.00 4 $5.00  $148,360.00 $2.00 $59,344.00 $2.50 $74,180.00
5 2" COMP. HMA 9.5M64 SURF. COURSE 4317 TON $75.00 $323,775.00 5 $3500  $151,095.00 $85.00 $366,945.00 $73.50 $317,299.50
6 3" BITUMINOUS PAVEMENT MILLING 4200 sY $4.50 $18,900.00 6 $5.00 $21,000.00 $2.00 $8,400.00 $3.50 $14,700.00 NO BID SUBMITTED

7 3" COMP. HMA12.5M64 SURF. COURSE 882 TON $75.00 $66,150.00 7 $55.00 $48,510.00 $79.00 $69,678.00 $79.00 $69,678.00
8 SAFETY GRATES 7 UNIT $800.00 $5,600.00 8 $240.00 $1,680.00 $300.00 $2,100.00 $350.00 $2,450.00
9 TYPE 'N' ECO INLET HEADS 55 UNIT $400.00 $22,000.00 9 $300.00 $16,500.00 $300.00 $16,500.00 $405.00 $22,275.00
10 DISTRESSED PAVEMENT REPLACEMENT 4820 SY $40.00 $192,800.00 10 $9.00 $43,380.00 $35.53 $171,254.60 $14.00 $67,480.00
11 DISTRESSED SUBGRADE REPLACEMENT 850 cy $35.00 $29,750.00 11 $0.01 $8.50 $55.00 $46,750.00 $31.00 $26,350.00
12 6"X8"X18" CONC. CURB REPLACEMENT 2325 LF $35.00 $81,375.00 12 $24.00 $55,800.00 $32.00 $74,400.00 $34.00 $79,050.00
13 INLET REPAIR 40 UNIT $750.00 $30,000.00 13 $500.00 $20,000.00 $400.00 $16,000.00 $750.00 $30,000.00
14 INLET RECONSTRUCTION 4 UNIT $3,500.00 $14,000.00 14 $1,100.00 $4,400.00 $1,350.00 $5,400.00 $1,000.00 $4,000.00
15 CONVERT TYPE 'B' INLET TO TYPE 'E' INLET 1 UNIT $1,000.00 $1,000.00 15 $1,100.00 $1,100.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00
16 CONSTRUCT INLET CHANNEL 3 UNIT $500.00 $1,500.00 16 $300.00 $900.00 $400.00 $1,200.00 $1,000.00 $3,000.00
17 BITUMINOUS DRIVEWAY APRON 246 sY $30.00 $7,380.00 17 $29.00 $7,134.00 $58.60 $14,415.60 $40.00 $9,840.00
18 CRACK SEALING 2896 LF $3.00 $8,688.00 18 $0.60 $1,737.60 $3.25 $9,412.00 $1.75 $5,068.00
19 CRACK REPAIR 4281 LF $20.00 $85,620.00 19 $1.60 $6,849.60 $14.85 $63,572.85 $0.85 $3,638.85
20 24" THERMOPLASTIC STOP BAR 168 LF $6.00 $1,008.00 20 $9.00 $1,512.00 $9.75 $1,638.00 $5.00 $840.00
21 4" EPOXY STRIPING 2330 LF $1.00 $2,330.00 21 $0.90 $2,097.00 $0.88 $2,050.40 $0.70 $1,631.00
22 5" TOPSOIL, SEED, FERT., LIME AND MULGH 5000 sy $6.00 $30,000.00 22 $1.00 $5,000.00 $4.75 $23,750.00 $5.00 $25,000.00
23 UNDERDRAIN 1100 LF $35.00 $38,500.00 23 $10.00 $11,000.00 $21.40 $23,540.00 $30.00 $33,000.00
24 TYPE 'E' INLET 1 UNIT $3,500.00 $3,500.00 24 $3,376.30 $3,376.30 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00
25 3/4" CLEAN CRUSHED STONE FOUND. MAT. 3 cY $35.00 $105.00 25 $50.00 $150.00 $30.00 $90.00 $100.00 $300.00
26 POLICE TRAFFIC DIRECTOR IF AND WHERE DIR. 32 HOUR $55.00 $1,760.00 26 $55.00 $1,760.00 $55.00 $1,760.00 $55.00 $1,760.00
27 CONTINGENCY 1 LUMP SUM $70,000.00 $70,000.00 27 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00
28 EROSION CONTROL BLANKET 70 sy $5.00 $350.00 28 $15.00 $1,050.00 $10.00 $700.00 $10.00 $700.00
29 FUEL ADJUSTMENT 1 LUMP SUM $1,500.00 $1,500.00 29 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00
30 ASPHALT ADJUSTMENT 1 LUMP SUM $7,000.00 $7,000.00 30 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00
TOTAL AMOUNT BID, 7/ $1,263,443.00 $883,000.00 $1,111,100.45 | $992,240.35

HERBERT J. SEEBURGER, JR.
N.J.P.E. NO. 24GE04748700




BID SUMMARY SHEET

Prepared By
Van Cleef Engineering Associates

4 AAA Drive, Suite 102, Hamilton, NJ 08691

MUNICIPALITY: HOPEWELL TOWNSHIP

DATE: 7/20/11 TIME: 09:00 AM

SHEET 2 OF 2

THE EARLE COMPANIES INTERCOUNTY PAVING ASSOCIATES |JONICO INC. MANNON EXCAVATING & PAVING ~ |SCHIFANO CONSTRUCTION CORP  [TOP LINE CONSTRUCTION CORP  |TRAP ROCK INDUSTRIES, INC
1800 RT. 34, BLDG. 2, SUITE 205 (859 WILLOW GROVE STREET 3861 NANLYN FARM CIRCLE 356 HWY. 31 ONE SMALLEY AVENUE 22 FIFTH STREET 460 RIVER ROAD, PO BOX 419
WALL, NJ 07719 HACKETTSTOWN, NJ 07840 DOYLESTOWN, PA FLEMINGTON, NJ 08822 MIDDLESEX, NJ 08846 SOMERVILLE, NJ 08876 KINGSTON, NJ 08528
732.308.1113, FAX 732.308.1034 |908.852.5868, FAX 908.852.0944 609.397.7556, FAX 609.697.7744  |908.782.4770, FAX 908.782.5276 732.356.4140, FAX 732.752.3473 908.231.7570, FAX 908.231.7402  [609.924.0300, FAX 609.497.0135
CHK/IBOND
ITEM NO. PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL

1 $49,50829  $49,508.29 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $25,850.00 $25,850.00 $85,000.00 $85,000.00

2 $15,500.00 $15,500.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $20,750.00 $20,750.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00

3 $250.00 $250.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $100.00 $100.00

4 $4.95  $146,876.40 $2.45 $72,696.40 $1.75 $51,926.00 $1.85 $54,893.20

5 $99.36  $428,937.12 $82.00 $353,994.00 $70.00 $302,190.00 $73.15  $315,788.55

6 $495  $20,790.00 $5.50 $23,100.00 NO BID SUBMITTED NO BID SUBMITTED $2.15 $9,030.00 $2.80 $11,760.00 NO BID SUBMITTED

7 $98.36  $86,753.52 $82.00 $72,324.00 ' $70.00 $61,740.00 $72.95 $64,341.90

8 $212.40 $1,486.80 $215.00 $1,505.00 $317.00 $2,219.00 $225.00 $1,575.00

9 $1,176.84  $64,726.20 $295.00 $16,225.00 $295.00 $16,225.00 $310.00 $17,050.00

10 $1325  $63,865.00 $35.00 $168,700.00 $45.00 $216,900.00 $16.50 $79,530.00

11 $11.57 $9,834.50 $30.00 $25,500.00 $45.00 $38,250.00 $35.00 $29,750.00

12 $31.16  $72,447.00 $21.00 $48,825.00 $39.50 $91,837.50 $24.15 $56,148.75

13 $450.17  $18,006.80 $775.00 $31,000.00 $765.00 $30,600.00 $475.00 $19,000.00

14 $1,150.17 $4,600.68 $1,200.00 $4,800.00 $1,500.00 $6,000.00 $950.00 $3,800.00

15 $1,193.58 $1,193.58 $2,600.00 $2,600.00 $1,285.00 $1,285.00 $750.00 $750.00

16 $520.97 $1,562.91 $500.00 $1,500.00 $450.00 $1,350.00 $125.00 $375.00

17 $24.70 $6,076.20 $35.00 $8,610.00 $40.00 $9,840.00 $26.25 $6,457.50

18 $2.73 $7,906.08 $2.00 $5,792.00 $1.95 $5,647.20 $1.50 $4,344.00

19 $5.53  $23,673.93 $20.00 $85,620.00 $25.00 $107,025.00 $4.00 $17,124.00

20 $8.72 $1,464.96 $8.00 $1,344.00 $5.50 $924.00 $9.75 $1,638.00

21 $0.80 $1,864.00 $0.73 $1,700.90 $0.75 $1,747.50 $0.88 $2,050.40

22 $0.63 $3,150.00 $5.45 $27,250.00 $0.01 $50.00 $6.85 $34,250.00

23 $23.84  $26,224.00 * SEE NOTE $4,000.00 $39.45 $43,395.00 $23.00 $25,300.00

24 $4,341.57 $4,341.57 * SEE NOTE $50.00 $1,950.00 $1,950.00 $3,950.00 $3,950.00

25 $33.53 $100.59 $50.00 $150.00 $50.00 $150.00 $80.00 $240.00

26 $55.00 $1,760.00 $55.00 $1,760.00 $55.00 $1,760.00 $55.00 $1,760.00

27 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00

28 $5.90 $413.00 $48.50 $3,395.00 $15.00 $1,050.00 $2.75 $192.50

29 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00

30 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00

$1,141,813.13 * SEE NOTE $1,112,441.30 $1,128,691.20 $918,168.80

*NOTE ON INTERCOUNTY BID:
ITEM 23) BOTH UNIT PRICE AND TOTAL AMOUNT WERE WRITTEN AS 4,000.00. FOR PURPOSES OF THIS SUMMARY, IT IS ASSUMED THE TOTAL COST GOVERNS.

ITEM 24) UNIT PRICE WRITTEN AS $50, AND TOTAL AS $150.00 WHILE THERE IS ONLY ONE (1) UNIT QUANTITY. THIS SUMMARY ASSUMES THE WRITTEN UNIT PRICE GOVERNS,
TOTAL AMOUNT BID: MATHEMATICAL ERROR IN BID. TOTAL GIVEN AS $1,139,891.30. TOTAL PRESENTED ABOVE REPRESENTS $27,450.00 DIFFERENCE.




