BID SUMMARY SHEET
Prepared By

Van Cleef Engineering Associales
4 AAA Drive, Suite 102, Hamilton, NJ 08691

MUKICIPALITY. HOPEWELL TOWNSHIP OATE: 03-18-10
—

TIME: 10:00 AM  SHEET 10F 3

ABC Construction AL Services, Inc. Ar do's C Inc. D i C i
CONTRACT B10-01 LAWRENCE-HOPEWELL TRAIL ENGINEER'S 714 Dunksferry Road PO Box 6391 311 Dickinson Street 35 Beaverson Blvd,
PENNINGTON-ROCKY HILL ROAD AT BAILEY DRIVE ESTIMATE Bensalem, PA 19020 669 Littleton Road Tranton, NJ 08638 Suite 9A
Parsippany, NJ 07054 Brick, NJ 08723
CERTIFIED CHECK OR BID BOND AMOUNT CHKIBOND _|bond boLd
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION QUJTTIY [AND UNITS PRICE TOTAL ITE=M NO. PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL

1 MOBILIZATION 1.0 LUMP SUM $10,000.00 $10,000.00 1 $4,260.00 $4,260.00 510,000.00 $10,000.00

2 SITE CLEARING 1.0 LUMP SUM $5,000.00 $5,000.00 2 $8,520.00 58,520.00 MO BID $5,000.00 $5,000.00 NO BID
3 SOIL EROSON AND SEDIMENT CONTROL 1.0 LUMP SUM $5,000.00 $5,000.00 a §10,512.00 $10,512.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
4 |6"XE"X 18" 4500 PS| CONC. CURB REPLACEMENT 380 LF $30.00 $1,140.00 4 $130.00 $4,940.00 $20.00 $760.00
5 6"X8"X18" 4500 PS| CONC. CURB 61.0 LF $30.00 $1,830.00 5 $50.00 $3,050.00 $18.00 $1,096.00
6 5~ TOPSOIL, SEED, FERT, LIME & MULCH 1563.0 5Y $5.50] $8,596.50 [ $14.00 $21,882.00 $18.00 $28,134.00
7 HANDICAP RAMP DELINEATION 320 SF $50.00 $1,600.00 7 $21.00 $672.00 $25.00 $800.00
8 4" THICK 4500 PSI CONC. SIDEWALK 427.0 SF 56.50 $2,775.50 8 $10.00 $4,270.00 $7.00 $2,989.00
] EXCAVATION (UNCLASSIFIED) 619.0 cY $25.00 $15,475.00 2 $41.00 $25,379.00 $15.00 $9,285.00
10 3" COMP. POROUS BIT. PAVEMENT 182.0 TON $175.00 $31,850.00 10 $240.00 $43,680.00 §150.00 $27.300.00
1" 2" THICK 3/4° CLEAN CRUSHED CHOKE STONE 57.0 cY $35.00 $1,995.00 1" $36.00 §2,052.00 5100.00 $5,700.00
12 8" THICK 1 1/2" CLEAN CRUSHED STONE 226.0 cY $35.00 §7,910.00 12 $40.00 $9,040.00 $100.00 $22,600.00
13 FILTER FABRIC 1343.0 8Y §3.15 54,230.45 13 $3.00 $4,029.00 $3.00 $4,029.00
14 DOUBLE SIDED STANDARD W BEAM WEATHERING STEEL GUIDE RAIL 385 LF 5$75.00 5$29,625.00 14 $80.00 $31,600.00 $30.00 $11,850.00
15 EXTRUDER TERMIMAL 2 UNIT $2,000.00 $4,000.00 15 $300.00 $600.00 $4,500.00 $0,000.00
16 12" RCP, CLASS I 18 LF $30.00 $480.00 16 $70.00 $1,120.00 5$60.00 $1.280.00
17 3/4" CLEAN CRUSHED STONE FOUNDATION MATERIAL 1 cY $35.00 535.00 17 $30.00 $30.00 $100.00 $100.00
12 12" FLARED END SECTION 2 UNIT $2,000.00 $4,000.00 18 $110.00 $220.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00
19 EROSION CONTROL FABRIC (IF AND WHERE DIRECTED) 50 sY $4.00 $200.00 19 §3.00 $150.00 $25.00 $1,250.00
20 AMELANCHIER CANADENSIS, SHADBLOW SERVICEBERRY, &' HT, B&B 1 UNIT $319.00 $319.00 20 550000 $500.00 $350.00 $350.00
21 BETULA NIGRA, RIVER BIRCH, 8 HT, B&B 1 UNIT $250.00 $250.00 21 $640.00 $640.00 $350.00 $350.00
22 CORMUS FLORIDA, FLOWERING DOGWOOD, 8' HT, B&B 1 UNIT $275.00 $275.00 22 $510.00 $510.00 $350.00 $350.00
23 ILEX OPACA, AMERICAN HOLLY, 6'HT, B&B 17 UNIT 5200.00 §3,400.00 23 $650.00 $11,050.00 5100.00 §1.700.00
24 PINUS STROBUS, EASTERN WHITE PINE, 6' HT, B&B 1 UNIT $145.00 $145.00 24 $450.00 $450.00 $350.00 $350.00
25 JUNIPERUS VIRGINIANA, EASTERN REDCEDAR, &' HT, BAB 25 UNIT $125.00 $3,125.00 25 $460.00 $11,500.00 $150.00 $3,750.00
26 FRAXINUS AMERICANA, GREEN ASH, 2 1/2" CAL, B&B 1 UNIT $250.00 $250.00 26 $600.00 §600.00 $350.00 $350.00
27 LIQUIDAMBER STYRACIFLUA, SWEETGUM, 2 1/2° CAL, B&B 1 UNIT $200.00 $200.00 27 $580.00 §590.00 $350.00 $350.00
28 NYSSA SYLVATICA, BLACK GUM, 2 1/2° CAL, B&B 1 UNIT $200.00 $200.00 28 $580.00 $590.00 $350.00 $350.00
29 QUERCUS RUBRUM, NORTHERN RED OAK, 2 1/2° CAL, B&B 1 UNIT $260.00 $260.00 29 $610.00 $610.00 $350.00 $350.00
30 ULMUS PARVIFORIA DYNASTY", DYNASTY ELM, 2 1/2° CAL, B&B 1 UNIT §350.00 $350.00 30 $580.00 $580.00 $350.00 $350.00
3 ILEX GLABRA, INKBERRY, 18" MIN, #3 CAN 28 uNIT $25.00 $700.00 kXl $110.00 $3,080.00 $50.00 §1.400.00
32 LINDERA BENZOIN, SPICEBUSH, 18" MIN, #3 CAN 26 UNIT $25.00 $650.00 32 5120.00 $3,120.00 5$50.00 $1,300.00
33 CLETHRA ALNIFOLIA, SUMMERSWEET, 158" MIN, #3 CAN 52 UNIT $25.00 $1,300.00 33 $115.00 $5,980.00 $50.00 $2,600.00
34 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL 1 LUMP SUM §5,000.00 $5,000.00 34 $10,650.00 $10,650.00 510,000.00 §10,000.00
35 FOUNDATION, TYPE SFT 3 UNIT $1,700.00 $5,100.00 35 $430.00 $1,290.00 $2,500.00 $7.500.00
36 TRAFFIC SIGNAL STANDARD, ALUMINUM, TYPE T, POWDER COATED BLACK 3 UNIT $5,500.00 $16,500.00 36 $1,000.00 $3,000.00 5§4,000.00 $12,000.00
37 REGULATORY AND WARNING SIGNS 95.5 SF $37.00 $3,533.50 37 $30.00 $2,885.00° $50.00 $4,775.00
38 SIGN RELOCATION 1 UNIT $300.00 $300,00 38 $430.00 §430.00 $100.00 $100.00
33 RECTANGULAR RAPID FLASHING BEACON SYSTEM- UNIDIRECTIONAL, COMPY 1 UNIT $5,000.00 55,000.00 39 $2,130.00 $2,130.00 $11,500.00 §11,500.00
40 RECTANGULAR RAFID FLASHING BEACON SYSTEM- BI-DIRECTIONAL, COMPLH 2 UNIT $6,000.00 $12,000.00 40 $6,400.00 $12,8600.00 $11,500.00 $23,000.00
41 PUSH BUTTON 2 UNIT §400.00 $B800.00 Eal $2,130.00 §4,260.00 $400.00 $800.00
42 TRAFFIC MARKINGS, THERMOPLASTIC 342 SF $7.00 $2,394.00 42 510.00 $3,420.00 $5.00 $1,710.00
43 TRAFFIC STRIPES, LONG LIFE, EPOXY RESIN, 4" 100 LF §1.50 $150.00 43 57.00 5700.00 $6.00 $600.00
a4 RIP-RAP CONDUIT OUTLET PROTECTION 4 cY $75.00 $300.00 44 $50.00 5200.00 $100.00 $400.00
45 CONTINGENCY 1.0 LS $5,000.00] $5,000.00 45 $5.000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 £5,000.00

TOTAL AMOUNT BID r $203,243.95 $262,551.00 *) MO BID $237,960.00 NO BID

T

HERBERT J. SEEBURGER, JR.
MN.J.P.E. NO. 24GE04748700

* Indicates mathematical error in bid



BID SUMMARY SHEET
Prepared By

Van Cleef Engineering Associales
4 AAA Drive, Suite 102, Hamilton, NJ 08691

MUNICIPALITY: HOPEWELL TOWNSHIP  DATE 03-18-10 _ TIME: 1000 AM__ SHEET 2 0F 3

[Earle Asphalt Companies Forcellati Bros., Inc. Halecon, Inc. Harris Blacktopping, Inc. J. Fletcher Creamer and Son Jonico, Inc.

920 Hwy 33, Bldg. 7 691 Rivervale Road 136 Billlan Street 869 Sandy Run Read 1219 Mays Landing Road PO Box 751

Freehold, NJ 07728 River Vale, NJ 07675 Bridgewater, NJ 08807 Yardley, PA 19067 Falsom, NJ 08037 Lambertville, NJ 08530
CHICEOND _oond pond Joond
ITEM NO. PRICE TOTA& PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL

1 54,842.88 54,842.88 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $1,615.00 51,615.00
2 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 NO BID $5,000.00 $5,000.00 NO BID NO BID §8,000.00 $8,000.00
3 $5,250.00 $5,250.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00
4 $31.00 $1,178.00 $50.00 $1,900.00 $18.00 $684.00
5 524.00 $1,464.00 $50.00 §3,050.00 $17.00 §1,037.00
6 54.25 $6,642.75 $7.50 $11,722.50 $3.00 $4,689.00
T 524.00 $768.00 $100.00 $3,200.00 $25.00 $800.00
8 §7.50 $3,202.50 57.00 $2,989.00 $6.00 §2,562.00
] $13.00 $8,047.00 $30.00 518.570.00 $20.00 $12,380.00
10 $150.00  527,300.00 $130.00 $23,660.00 * $100.00 $18,200.00
11 $31.00 §1,767.00 §100.00 $5,700.00 $80.00 £4,560.00
12 $21.00 $4,746.00 $85.00 $19,210.00 $60.00 $13,560.00
13 $1.50 $2,014.50 $2.00 $2,686.00 $1.00 $1,343.00
14 $27.00 $10,665.00 $30.00 $11,850.00 $28.00 $11,060.00
15 $2,630.00 $5,260.00 54,000.00 $8,000.00 $2,700.00 55,400.00
16 $60.00 $960.00 $100.00 $1,600.00 $100.00 $1,600.00
17 §23.00 523.00 550.00 $50.00 $80.00 $80.00
18 $1,280.00 $2,580.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00
19 $9.50 5475.00 $5.00 $250.00 $3.00 $150.00
20 $270.00 $270.00 $425.00 $425.00 $330.00 $330.00
21 §280.00 $280.00 5275.00 $275.00 §250.00 $250.00
22 $280.00 $280.00 $300.00 $300.00 $270.00 $270.00
23 $300.00 $5,100.00 $350.00 $5,950.00 $380.00 $6,460.00
24 5$190.00 $190.00 $200.00 5200.00 $290.00 $290.00
25 $140.00 $3,500.00 $180.00 $4,500.00 $220.00 $5,500.00
26 $290.00 $280.00 $450.00 $450.00 $290.00 $290.00
27 $290.00 $290.00 $400.00 $400.00 $290.00 $290.00
28 $290.00 $290.00 §525.00 $525.00 $290.00 $290.00
29 $300.00 $300.00 $500.00 $500.00 $290.00 $290.00
30 $360.00 $360.00 5$500.00 $500.00 $290.00 $290.00
3 $36.00 51,008.00 $50.00 $1,400.00 $65.00 $1,820.00
3z $36.00 $936.00 $50.00 $1,300.00 $65.00 $1,690.00
33 $36.00 §1,872.00 540,00 $2,080.00 $65.00 $3,380.00
34 §$4,480.00 $4,460.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $1,500.00 §1,500.00
a5 $1,580.00 £4,740.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00 $1,600.00 $4,800.00
36 $2,630.00 §7,680.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $1,600.00 $4,800.00
ar §34.00 $3,247.00 $40.00 $3,620.00 $24.00 $2,292.00
38 $130.00 $130.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00
39 $9,930.00 $9,930.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00
40 $10,180.00  $20,360.00 $12,000.00 $24,000.00 §11,500.00 $23,000.00
41 $320.00 $640.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $300.00 $600.00
42 $375 $1,282.50 $5.00 $1,710.00 $4.00 $1,368.00
43 $8.50 $850.00 $10.00 $1,000.00 $10.00 $1,000.00
44 §$33.00 $132.00 §150.00 $600.00 $60.00 $240.00
45 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
$169,313.13 NO BID $229,572.50 * NO 8ID NO BID $169,960.00

* Indicates mathematical error in bid




BID SUMMARY SHEET

Prepared By
Van Cleef Enginearing Associates
4 AAA Drive, Suite 102, Hamilton, NJ 08691
MUNICIPALITY: HOPEWELL TOWNSHIP _ DATE: 03-16-10  TIME! 10:00 AM _ SHEET3OF 3
—
KDP Developers ML Ruberton Construction Co [Renda Roads ROBCON Constracting Top Line Construction
220 Goodsprings Road PO Box 564 6 Commerce Street 705 Route 71 22 Fifth Streat
Stewartsville, NJ 08886 Hammonton, NJ 08037 Branchburg, NJ 08876 Brielle, NJ 08730 Somerville, NJ 08876
CHK/BOND _|bond bond |bond
ITEM NO. PRICE TOTAL Pﬁ TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
5$8,800.00 59,800.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $1,650.00 $1,650.00
2 $3,800.00 $3,800.00 MO BID $5.000.00 §5,000.00 NO BID 57,925.00 §7,925.00
3 $3,620.00 $3,620.00 $6,100.00 $6,100.00 $3,150.00 $3,150.00
4 $22.00 $836.00 $32.50 $1,235.00 $30.00 $1,140.00
5 522.00 $1,342.00 $29.00 $1,769.00 $28.00 $1,708.00
[ §3.25 $5,079.75 $5.50 58,596.50 $3.15 $4,923.45
7 $75.00 $2,400.00 5$18.55 $625.60 $20.50 $656.00
8 $8.25 $352275 $5.25 $2,241.75 §7.50 $3,202.50
] $30.00 $18,570.00 $24.50 $15,165.50 $15.50 $9,594.50
10 $138.00 $25,116.00 §124.25 52261350 $103.25 $18,791.50
1 5$96.00 $6,472.00 $50.00 $2,850.00 560,40 $3,442.80
12 $78.00 $17,628.00 $50.00 $11,300.00 §52.30 $11,819.80
13 51.85 $2,484.55 $1.75 $2,350.25 $0.95 §1.275.85
14 $24.00 $8,480.00 $25.30 $9,993.50 $27.30 $10,783.50
15 $3,600.00 $7,200.00 $2,300.00 $4,600.00 $2,625.00 $5,250.00
16 $87.00 $1,392.00 $105.00 $1,680.00 $71.00 $1,136.00
17 $40.00 $40.00 $90.00 $90.00 $21.45 $21.45
18 51,100.00 $2,200.00 §1,400.00 $2,800.00 $1,125.00 $2,250.00
19 $3.00 $150.00 511.50 $575.00 $4.00 $200.00
20 $250.00 $250.00 $330.00 $330.00 $236.25 $236.25
21 $300.00 $300.00 $330.00 $330.00 $289.80 §289.80
2 $360.00 $360.00 $330.00 $330.00 $343.35 $343.35
23 $410.00 $6,970.00 $522.50 $8,882.50 $393.75 $6,693.75
24 $150.00 $150.00 $192.50 $192.50 5141.75 $141.75
25 $275.00 $6,875.00 $126.50 $3,162.50 5264.60 $6,615.00
28 $410.00 $410.00 $396.00 $396.00 $3935.75 $393.75
2r $375.00 $375.00 §385.00 $385.00 $359.10 $358.10
28 $550.00 $550.00 $385.00 $385.00 $529.20 $629.20
29 $300.00 $300.00 $214.50 $214.50 $283.50 $283.50
30 $475.00 $475.00 $330.00 $330.00 $453.60 $453.60
3 5$50.00 $1,400.00 $55.00 51,540.00 $47.25 $1,323.00
32 $55.00 $1,430.00 $55.00 $1,430.00 $50.40 $1.310.40
33 $46.00 $2,392.00 $55.00 $2,860.00 $44.10 $2,203.20
34 $9.670.00 $9,670.00 $5,600.00 $5,600.00 $3,820.00 $3,820.00
35 §1,800.00 $5,400.00 $3,476.00 5$10,428.00 $1,890.00 $5,670.00
38 §2,400.00 $7,200.00 $2,310,00 $6,930.00 $2,360.00 $7,080.00
37 $35.00 $3,342.50 51975 51,886.13 $33.60 $3,208.80
38 $200.00 $200.00 $150.00 $150.00 5131.25 $131.25
39 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $11,680.00 $11,660.00 $9,920.00 $9,920.00
40 $10,100.00 $20,200.00 $12,067.00 5$24,134.00 $10,235.00 $20,470.00
41 5450.00 $900.00 $467.50 $935.00 $388.50 $777.00
42 $4.50 $1,539.00 $4.00 $1,368.00 §3.65 §1,248.30
43 58.00 $800.00 $9.20 $920.00 $8.40 $840.00
44 $120.00 $480.00 $205.00 $620.00 5106.50 $426.00
45 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 SSiUDO‘DCI $5,000.00
$205,601.55 NO BID $196,184.73 NOBID $168,777.35




