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Van Cleef Engineering Associates

4 AAA Drive, Suite 102, Hamilton, NJ 08691

MUNICIPALITY: HOPEWELL TOWNSHIP        DATE: 10-18-11       TIME: 10:00 AM       SHEET 1 OF 2

RIPI CONCRETE LLC ARMANDO'S CONSTRUCTION JONICO INC GRASSBUSTERS LANDSCAPING BUD CONCRETE INC DIAMOND CONSTRUCTION A & A CURBING INC F & P CONTRACTORS INC

CONTRACT B11-11 ENGINEER'S 11 MICHAEL MCCORRISTIN RD 311 DICKINSON ST PO BOX 751 383 HUTTON RD 133 SEWELL RD 35 BEAVERTON BLVD, SUITE 12C 15 TERRY AVE 659 WASHINGTON AVE

TITUSVILLE SIDEWALK REPLACEMENT ESTIMATE TRENTON, NJ 08690 TRENTON, NJ 08638 LAMBERTVILLE, NJ 08530 ELKTON, MD 21921 SEWELL, NJ 08080 BRICK, NJ 08723 SOUTH RIVER, NJ 08882 SOUTH AMBOY, NJ 08879
609-587-1784 609-434-1441 609-397-7556 302-292-1166 856-859-2123 732-262-7449 732-254-0650 732-721-3213

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY AND UNITS PRICE TOTAL ITEM NO. PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
1 MOBILIZATION AND SITE CLEARING 1.0 LUMP SUM $10,000.00 $10,000.00 1 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $73,181.00 $73,181.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00
2 SOIL EROSON AND SEDIMENT CONTROL 1.0 LUMP SUM $2,500.00 $2,500.00 2 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $500.00 $500.00
3 6"X8"x18" CONCRETE CURB 4500 PSI 293.0 LF $15.00 $4,395.00 3 $18.00 $5,274.00 $20.00 $5,860.00 $30.00 $8,790.00 $32.00 $9,376.00
4 CONCRETE CURB AND GUTTER 4500 PSI 360.0 LF $25.00 $9,000.00 4 $25.00 $9,000.00 $30.00 $10,800.00 $35.00 $12,600.00 $34.00 $12,240.00
5 MOUNTABLE CONCRETE CURB 4500 PSI 100.0 LF $15.00 $1,500.00 5 $25.00 $2,500.00 $25.00 $2,500.00 $35.00 $3,500.00 $36.00 $3,600.00
6 CONCRETE SIDEWALK TYPE 1 4500 PSI 4851.0 SF $4.00 $19,404.00 6 $6.50 $31,531.50 $5.00 $24,255.00 $5.00 $24,255.00 $6.50 $31,531.50
7 CONCRETE SIDEWALK TYPE 2 4500 PSI 4033.0 SF $8.00 $32,264.00 7 $9.00 $36,297.00 $10.00 $40,330.00 $5.00 $20,165.00 $11.50 $46,379.50
8 HANDICAPPED RAMP DELINEATION 110.0 SF $200.00 $22,000.00 8 $45.00 $4,950.00 $55.00 $6,050.00 $15.00 $1,650.00 $25.00 $2,750.00
9 CONCRETE DRIVEWAY APRON TYPE 1 4500 PSI 3177.0 SF $8.00 $25,416.00 9 $9.00 $28,593.00 $11.00 $34,947.00 $5.00 $15,885.00 $12.50 $39,712.50

10 CONCRETE DRIVEWAY APRON TYPE 2 4500 PSI 116.0 SF $12.00 $1,392.00 10 $11.00 $1,276.00 $7.00 $812.00 $5.00 $580.00 $7.50 $870.00
11 CONCRETE DRIVEWAY APRON TYPE 3 4500 PSI 749.0 SF $12.00 $8,988.00 11 $11.00 $8,239.00 $11.00 $8,239.00 $5.00 $3,745.00 $12.50 $9,362.50
12 DRY LAID BRICK PAVER SIDEWALK 22.0 SF $15.00 $330.00 12 $30.00 $660.00 $15.00 $330.00 $20.00 $440.00 $17.00 $374.00
13 GRAVEL DRIVEWAY APRON 29.0 SF $3.00 $87.00 13 $3.00 $87.00 $15.00 $435.00 $5.00 $145.00 $3.00 $87.00
14 STONE SHOULDER 504.0 SY $30.00 $15,120.00 14 $10.00 $5,040.00 $20.00 $10,080.00 $30.00 $15,120.00 $18.00 $9,072.00
15 TYPE 'A' INLET 2.0 UNIT $2,500.00 $5,000.00 15 NO BID $4,000.00 $8,000.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00
16 ROADWAY EXCAVATION (UNCLASSIFIED) 229.0 CY $15.00 $3,435.00 16 $25.00 $5,725.00 $50.00 $11,450.00 $1.00 $229.00 $43.00 $9,847.00
17 6" COMP. DENSE GRADED AGGREGATE SUBBASE 612.0 SY $8.00 $4,896.00 17 $3.00 $1,836.00 $10.00 $6,120.00 $1.00 $612.00 $9.00 $5,508.00
18 5" COMP. HMA19M64 BASE COURSE 184.0 TON $70.00 $12,880.00 18 $90.00 $16,560.00 $110.00 $20,240.00 $150.00 $27,600.00 $90.00 $16,560.00
19 1.5" COMP. HMA9.5M64 SURFACE COURSE 55.0 TON $70.00 $3,850.00 19 $95.00 $5,225.00 $140.00 $7,700.00 $150.00 $8,250.00 $100.00 $5,500.00
20 2" COMP. HMA9.5M64 SURFACE COURSE 6.0 TON $70.00 $420.00 20 $95.00 $570.00 $200.00 $1,200.00 $180.00 $1,080.00 $100.00 $600.00
21 2" BITUMINOUS PAVEMENT MILLING 46.0 SY $5.00 $230.00 21 $5.00 $230.00 $30.00 $1,380.00 $10.00 $460.00 $40.00 $1,840.00
22 1 1/2" QUARRY BLEND SUBGRADE INCL. EXCAV. (IF AND WHERE) 100.0 CY $30.00 $3,000.00 22 $30.00 $3,000.00 $5.00 $500.00 $1.00 $100.00 $35.00 $3,500.00
23 24" THERMOPLASTIC HIVIS CROSSWALK STRIPING 114.0 LF $6.00 $684.00 23 $8.00 $912.00 $5.00 $570.00 $1.00 $114.00 $4.25 $484.50
24 24" THERMOPLASTIC STOP BAR 112.0 LF $6.00 $672.00 24 $8.00 $896.00 $5.00 $560.00 $10.00 $1,120.00 $4.25 $476.00
25 4" THERMOPLASTIC STRIPING 50.0 LF $1.00 $50.00 25 $8.00 $400.00 $3.00 $150.00 $1.00 $50.00 $3.00 $150.00
26 8" THERMOPLASTIC CROSSWALK STRIPING 201.0 LF $2.00 $402.00 26 $8.00 $1,608.00 $4.00 $804.00 $2.50 $502.50 $3.25 $653.25
27 ENDURABLEND OR EQUAL CROSSWALK SURFACING 618.0 SF $25.00 $15,450.00 27 $10.00 $6,180.00 $30.00 $18,540.00 $25.00 $15,450.00 $14.00 $8,652.00
28 SHADE TREE 1.0 UNIT $350.00 $350.00 28 $500.00 $500.00 $600.00 $600.00 $500.00 $500.00 $650.00 $650.00
29 DENSE GRADED AGGREGATE (INLET BACKFILL) 25.0 CY $35.00 $875.00 29 $25.00 $625.00 $10.00 $250.00 $1.00 $25.00 $35.00 $875.00
30 3/4" CLEAN CRUSHED STONE FOUNDATION (INLET) 5.0 CY $35.00 $175.00 30 $20.00 $100.00 $14.00 $70.00 $1.00 $5.00 $35.00 $175.00
31 TRAFFIC CONTROL 1.0 LUMP SUM $3,000.00 $3,000.00 31 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00
32 CONTINGENCY 1.0 LUMP SUM $8,000.00 $8,000.00 32 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID $215,765.00 $205,814.50 $310,953.00 $194,972.50 $254,325.75
A1 MOBILIZATION AND SITE CLEARING 1 LUMP SUM $5,000.00 $5,000.00 A1 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00
A2 SOIL EROSON AND SEDIMENT CONTROL 1 LUMP SUM $1,500.00 $1,500.00 A2 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $500.00 $500.00
A3 CONCRETE CURB AND GUTTER 4500 PSI 310 LF $25.00 $7,750.00 A3 $25.00 $7,750.00 $30.00 $9,300.00 $35.00 $10,850.00 $34.00 $10,540.00
A4 CONCRETE SIDEWALK TYPE 1 4500 PSI 1403 SF $4.00 $5,612.00 A4 $6.50 $9,119.50 $5.00 $7,015.00 $7.50 $10,522.50 $6.50 $9,119.50
A5 CONCRETE SIDEWALK TYPE 2 4500 PSI 96 SF $8.00 $768.00 A5 $11.00 $1,056.00 $10.00 $960.00 $7.50 $720.00 $11.50 $1,104.00
A6 HANDICAPPED RAMP DELINEATION 16 SF $200.00 $3,200.00 A6 $45.00 $720.00 $55.00 $880.00 $15.00 $240.00 $25.00 $400.00
A7 CONCRETE DRIVEWAY APRON TYPE 1 4500 PSI 85 SF $8.00 $680.00 A7 $9.00 $765.00 $11.00 $935.00 $7.50 $637.50 $12.50 $1,062.50
A8 CONCRETE DRIVEWAY APRON TYPE 2 4500 PSI 772 SF $12.00 $9,264.00 A8 NO BID $11.00 $8,492.00 $7.00 $5,404.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.50 $5,790.00 $7.50 $5,790.00
A9 ROADWAY EXCAVATION (UNCLASSIFIED) 100 CY $15.00 $1,500.00 A9 $25.00 $2,500.00 $50.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $100.00 $43.00 $4,300.00

A10 6" COMP. DENSE GRADED AGGREGATE SUBBASE 300 SY $8.00 $2,400.00 A10 $3.00 $900.00 $10.00 $3,000.00 $1.00 $300.00 $9.00 $2,700.00
A11 5" COMP. HMA19M64 BASE COURSE 90 TON $70.00 $6,300.00 A11 $90.00 $8,100.00 $110.00 $9,900.00 $200.00 $18,000.00 $90.00 $8,100.00
A12 1.5" COMP. HMA9.5M64 SURFACE COURSE 27 TON $70.00 $1,890.00 A12 $95.00 $2,565.00 $140.00 $3,780.00 $150.00 $4,050.00 $100.00 $2,700.00
A14 1 1/2" QUARRY BLEND SUBGRADE INCL. EXCAV. (IF AND WHERE) 50 CY $30.00 $1,500.00 A14 $30.00 $1,500.00 $5.00 $250.00 $0.10 $5.00 $35.00 $1,750.00
A15 TRAFFIC CONTROL 1 LUMP SUM $2,000.00 $2,000.00 A15 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $500.00 $500.00
A16 CONTINGENCY 1 LUMP SUM $5,000.00 $5,000.00 A16 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID A $54,364.00 $57,467.50 $71,424.00 $59,915.00 $54,566.00
B1 MOBILIZATION AND SITE CLEARING 1 LUMP SUM $3,000.00 $3,000.00 B1 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00
B2 SOIL EROSON AND SEDIMENT CONTROL 1 LUMP SUM $1,000.00 $1,000.00 B2 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $500.00 $500.00
B3 BELGIAN BLOCK CURB 408 LF $18.00 $7,344.00 B3 $22.00 $8,976.00 $30.00 $12,240.00 $20.00 $8,160.00 $30.00 $12,240.00
B4 CONCRETE SIDEWALK TYPE 1 4500 PSI 2076 SF $4.00 $8,304.00 B4 NO BID $6.50 $13,494.00 $5.00 $10,380.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.50 $15,570.00 $6.50 $13,494.00
B5 CONCRETE DRIVEWAY APRON TYPE 2 4500 PSI 660 SF $12.00 $7,920.00 B5 $9.00 $5,940.00 $10.00 $6,600.00 $7.50 $4,950.00 $11.50 $7,590.00
B6 24" THERMOPLASTIC HIVIS CROSSWALK STRIPING 80 LF $6.00 $480.00 B6 $8.00 $640.00 $5.00 $400.00 $1.00 $80.00 $4.25 $340.00
B7 TRAFFIC CONTROL 1 LUMP SUM $2,500.00 $2,500.00 B7 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00
B8 CONTINGENCY 1 LUMP SUM $4,000.00 $4,000.00 B8 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00

TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID B $34,548.00 $42,050.00 $52,620.00 $35,760.00 $40,164.00
C1 MOBILIZATION AND SITE CLEARING 1 LUMP SUM $5,000.00 $5,000.00 C1 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00
C2 SOIL EROSON AND SEDIMENT CONTROL 1 LUMP SUM $1,500.00 $1,500.00 C2 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $500.00 $500.00
C3 BELGIAN BLOCK CURB 1208 SF $4.00 $4,832.00 C3 $9.00 $10,872.00 $5.00 $6,040.00 $7.50 $9,060.00 $6.50 $7,852.00
C4 CONCRETE SIDEWALK TYPE 1 4500 PSI 316 SF $8.00 $2,528.00 C4 NO BID $11.00 $3,476.00 $10.00 $3,160.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.50 $2,370.00 $11.50 $3,634.00
C5 CONCRETE DRIVEWAY APRON TYPE 2 4500 PSI 8 SF $200.00 $1,600.00 C5 $45.00 $360.00 $55.00 $440.00 $15.00 $120.00 $25.00 $200.00
C6 24" THERMOPLASTIC HIVIS CROSSWALK STRIPING 324 SF $8.00 $2,592.00 C6 $9.00 $2,916.00 $11.00 $3,564.00 $7.50 $2,430.00 $12.50 $4,050.00
C7 TRAFFIC CONTROL 1 LUMP SUM $2,500.00 $2,500.00 C7 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $500.00 $500.00
C8 CONTINGENCY 1 LUMP SUM $3,500.00 $3,500.00 C8 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00

TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID C $24,052.00 $29,124.00 $25,204.00 $20,980.00 $20,236.00
D1 RADAR SPEED LIMIT SIGN (COMPLETE) 2 UNIT $5,000.00 $10,000.00 D1 NO BID $8,000.00 $16,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $8,500.00 $17,000.00 $6,900.00 $13,800.00

TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID D $10,000.00 $16,000.00 $20,000.00 $17,000.00 $13,800.00
TOTAL BASE BID + ALL ALTERNATE BIDS $338,729.00 $350,456.00 $480,201.00 $328,627.50 $383,091.75

HERBERT J. SEEBURGER, JR.

N.J.P.E. NO. 24GE04748700

BID SUMMARY SHEET


