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Land Tek Group, Inc. $691,900.00 $465,500.00 $497,800.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $228,200.00 $16,100.00 $19,000.00 $47,500.00 $334,000.00 $1,007,400.00 $409,325.00 $40,025.00 $27,250.00 $59,100.00 $47,100.00 $138,100.00
KC Construction Co. $864,000.00 $457,000.00 $488,000.00 $488,000.00 $496,000.00 $475,000.00 $325,000.00 $103,000.00 $15,000.00 $31,000.00 $414,000.00 $1,221,000.00 $492,000.00 $5,000.00 $20,000.00 $128,000.00 $225,000.00 $118,000.00
Atlantic Lining Co., Inc. $658,800.00 $480,300.00 $512,000.00 $512,000.00 $518,300.00 $499,300.00 $236,500.00 $15,000.00 $16,700.00 $33,700.00 $319,100.00 $1,020,700.00 $285,300.00 $28,500.00 $20,000.00 $74,300.00 $48,400.00 $135,400.00
Applied Landscape Technologies $718,663.00 $456,300.00 $487,987.50 $479,903.00 $485,197.00 NO BID $255,708.00 $20,160.00 $45,125.00 $95,812.00 $320,000.00 $1,197,350.00 $320,000.00 $38,353.00 $22,780.00 $69,000.00 $42,700.00 $224,000.00
Caruso Excavating, Inc. $845,000.00 $488,000.00 $500,500.00 $500,500.00 $507,500.00 $487,500.00 $265,000.00 $10,000.00 $8,400.00 $68,500.00 $335,000.00 $1,030,000.00 $487,000.00 $45,000.00 $25,000.00 $80,000.00 $50,000.00 $120,000.00
Tomco Construction, Inc. $639,520.00 $525,590.00 $558,645.00 NO BID NO BID $562,745.00 $265,650.00 $21,900.00 $8,600.00 $66,800.00 $433,800.00 $1,131,900.00 $334,000.00 $17,000.00 $56,050.00 $68,000.00 $80,500.00 $173,300.00
Turco Golf, Inc. $874,791.00 $479,100.00 $512,400.00 $512,200.00 $519,400.00 NO BID $307,543.00 $15,943.00 $8,400.00 $69,220.00 $334,933.00 $1,095,300.00 $589,641.00 $15,033.00 $26,292.00 $81,000.00 $47,234.00 $179,800.00

NOTE: BOLD = SUCCESSFUL VENDOR
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