BID RESULTS

2009 ROAD MATERIALS

B9-07
5/15/2009
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Unit /Total Unit /Total Unit /Total Unit /Total Unit /Total Unit /Total Unit /Total Total Bid g 5 2 2 535 £ gEE 5 SE3
Asphalt Paving Systems, 11$ No Bid $ 1.79 /$88,327.55 [$1.79 /$5,960.70 |$ 2.25/%$10,845.00 [$2.25 /$10,406.25 |$ No / Bid $ No / Bid $115,539.50 | x | x | x | x [ x| x| x| x x| x| x
Trap Rock Ind., Inc. $8.00tn /$24,000.00* |$ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ 23.70tn/$44,319.00** |$ 23.70tn / $5,498.40** $73817.40 | x | x | x| x| x| x| x| x| x| x| x| x
$24,000.00 $88,327.55 $5,960.70 $10,845.00 $10,406.25 $44,319.00 $5,498.40
Recycle TOTAL 24,000 |CRS2P TOTAL 94288.25 MC70 TOTAL 21,251.25 3/8" CLEANED STONE 49817.40

Bid was advertised May 5, 2009

7 bid packages were mailed

2 bids were received

Bids were opened May 15, 2009

*Brought to Pennington & Kingston

**Delivered to Township Yard




