
JONICO, INC. FLANAGAN'S CONTRACTING H & G CONTRACTORS DESAPIO CONTRUCTION DELL TECH HELIOS CONSTRUCTION

CONTRACT B8-11 ADA ACCESS IMPROVEMENTS ENGINEER'S PO BOX 751 90 OLD CHAMPLAIN ROAD 489 FAIRWAY ROAD 280 RIDGE ROAD 127 ROUTE 206 1321A ALLENHURST AVE.

WASHINGTON CROSSING STATE PARK ESTIMATE LAMBERTVILLE, NJ HILLSBOROUGH, NJ RIDGEWOOD, NJ FRENCHTOWN, NJ HAMILTON, NJ OCEAN, NJ

609-397-7556 908-429-1400 201-444-1008 908-996-3888 609-581-5190 732-663-0200

CERTIFIED CHECK OR BID BOND AMOUNT Bond $20,000 Bond $20,000 Bond $20,000

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY AND UNITS PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL

BID A

A1 MOBILIZATION 1 LUMP SUM $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $558,000.00 $558,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00

A2 SITE CLEARING 1 LUMP SUM $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00

A3 SOIL EROSION AND SEDIMENT CONTROL 1 LUMP SUM $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $6,185.00 $6,185.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00

A4 FLAGMEN 320 HOURS $35.00 $11,200.00 $85.00 $27,200.00 $30.00 $9,600.00 $56.00 $17,920.00

A5 CONES 75 UNIT $25.00 $1,875.00 $20.00 $1,500.00 $1.00 $75.00 $5.00 $375.00

A6 DRUMS 20 UNIT $75.00 $1,500.00 $75.00 $1,500.00 $5.00 $100.00 $1.00 $20.00

A7 BREAKAWAY BARRICADES 5 UNIT $150.00 $750.00 $95.00 $475.00 $25.00 $125.00 $100.00 $500.00

A8 SIGN W20-7A FLAGMAN 4 UNIT $150.00 $600.00 $400.00 $1,600.00 $50.00 $200.00 $50.00 $200.00

A9 24"X18" 100 FEET SUPPLEMENTAL PLATE 4 UNIT $100.00 $400.00 $75.00 $300.00 $9.00 $36.00 $25.00 $100.00

A10 SIGN W20-7B BE PREPARED TO STOP 4 UNIT $150.00 $600.00 $400.00 $1,600.00 $50.00 $200.00 $70.00 $280.00

A11 SIGN G20-2A END ROAD WORK 3 UNIT $150.00 $450.00 $75.00 $225.00 $50.00 $150.00 $70.00 $210.00

A12 SIGN R9-9 SIDEWALK CLOSED 3 UNIT $100.00 $300.00 $50.00 $150.00 $50.00 $150.00 $40.00 $120.00

A13 SIGN W20-4B ROAD WORK 1000 FT 1 UNIT $150.00 $150.00 $400.00 $400.00 $50.00 $50.00 $1.00 $1.00

A14 SIGN W20-4C ROAD WORK 500 FT 1 UNIT $150.00 $150.00 $400.00 $400.00 $50.00 $50.00 $1.00 $1.00

A15 SIGN W20-4 ONE LANE ROAD 800 FT 1 UNIT $150.00 $150.00 $400.00 $400.00 $50.00 $50.00 $80.00 $80.00

A16 TEST PITS (12' AVG. DEPTH) 3 UNIT $500.00 $1,500.00 $100.00 $300.00 $750.00 $2,250.00 $150.00 $450.00

A17 TEMP. STEEL SHEET PILES IF REQUIRED 3000 SF $12.50 $37,500.00 $1.00 $3,000.00 $15.00 $45,000.00 $15.00 $45,000.00

A18 EXCAVATION (UNCLASSIFIED) 1 LUMP SUM $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $38,000.00 $38,000.00 $195,000.00 $195,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00

A19

REINFORCED CONCRETE WALL AND FOOTING INCLUDING 

STONE VENEER, REINF. STEEL AND CAP STONE 350 CY $500.00 $175,000.00 $1,600.00 $560,000.00 $200.00 $70,000.00 $775.00 $271,250.00

A20 4" PERF. HDPE UNDERDRAIN 660 LF $10.00 $6,600.00 $12.00 $7,920.00 $30.00 $19,800.00 $6.00 $3,960.00

A21 3/4" CLEAN CRUSHED STONE FOR UNDERDRAINS 182 CY $30.00 $5,460.00 $33.00 $6,006.00 $35.00 $6,370.00 $80.00 $14,560.00

A22 MIRAFI 140N FILTER FABRIC OR EQUAL 1810 SY $3.00 $5,430.00 $2.00 $3,620.00 $1.00 $1,810.00 $4.00 $7,240.00

A23 TENSAR BX1100 GEOGRID OR EQUAL 265 SY $8.00 $2,120.00 $10.00 $2,650.00 $18.00 $4,770.00 $45.00 $11,925.00

A24 3/8" CLEAN CRUSHED STONE FOUNDATION MATERIAL 100 CY $30.00 $3,000.00 $45.00 $4,500.00 $35.00 $3,500.00 $85.00 $8,500.00

A25

1 1/2" QUARRY BLEND INCLUDING EXCAVATION IF AND 

WHERE DIRECTED 100 CY $30.00 $3,000.00 $48.00 $4,800.00 $30.00 $3,000.00 $70.00 $7,000.00

A26

6" THICK 4500 PSI CONC. SIDEWALK COLORED BROWN INCL. 

FOUNDATION STONE AND WWF 2282 SF $15.00 $34,230.00 $11.50 $26,243.00 $10.00 $22,820.00 $8.00 $18,256.00

A27 HANDICAPPED RAMP DELINEATION 64 SF $100.00 $6,400.00 $35.00 $2,240.00 $34.00 $2,176.00 $28.00 $1,792.00

A28 TYPE ML/CL COMPACTED BACKFILL 110 CY $30.00 $3,300.00 $42.00 $4,620.00 $50.00 $5,500.00 $60.00 $6,600.00

A29 COMPACTED SELECT FILL 600 CY $25.00 $15,000.00 $42.00 $25,200.00 $30.00 $18,000.00 $40.00 $24,000.00

A30 PIPE RAILING WITH HANDRAIL 238 LF $150.00 $35,700.00 $300.00 $71,400.00 $300.00 $71,400.00 $149.00 $35,462.00

A31 PIPE HANDRAIL (ONLY) 208 LF $50.00 $10,400.00 $250.00 $52,000.00 $50.00 $10,400.00 $50.00 $10,400.00

A32 6"X8"X18" 4500 PSI CONC. CURB 188 LF $30.00 $5,640.00 $30.00 $5,640.00 $30.00 $5,640.00 $15.00 $2,820.00

A33 6" COMP. DENSE GRADED AGGREGATE SUBBASE 100 SY $10.00 $1,000.00 $10.00 $1,000.00 $17.00 $1,700.00 $30.00 $3,000.00

A34 4" COMP. BITUMINOUS STAB. BASE MIX I-2 23 TON $75.00 $1,725.00 $250.00 $5,750.00 $150.00 $3,450.00 $200.00 $4,600.00

A35 2" COMP. BIT. CONC. SURFACE COURSE MIX I-5 12 TON $75.00 $900.00 $250.00 $3,000.00 $150.00 $1,800.00 $300.00 $3,600.00

A36 BRICK SIDEWALK 875 SF $30.00 $26,250.00 $17.00 $14,875.00 $20.00 $17,500.00 $24.00 $21,000.00

A37 TOW PATH 11 SY $100.00 $1,100.00 $10.00 $110.00 $80.00 $880.00 $50.00 $550.00

A38 STANDARD W BEAM WEATHERING STEEL GUIDE RAIL 38 LF $100.00 $3,800.00 $100.00 $3,800.00 $62.00 $2,356.00 $171.00 $6,498.00

A39 EXTRUDER TERMINAL 2 UNIT $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00

A40 12' TIMBER GATE WITH 3 POSTS AND HARDWARE 2 UNIT $8,000.00 $16,000.00 $4,700.00 $9,400.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $6,500.00 $13,000.00

A41 HANDICAPPED PARKING SIGNS 4 UNIT $350.00 $1,400.00 $400.00 $1,600.00 $250.00 $1,000.00 $200.00 $800.00

A42 CONCRETE PARKING BUMPER BLOCKS 4 UNIT $200.00 $800.00 $100.00 $400.00 $50.00 $200.00 $40.00 $160.00

A43 RESET INLET GRATE 1 UNIT $250.00 $250.00 $500.00 $500.00 $300.00 $300.00 $100.00 $100.00

A44 24" THERMOPLASTIC STOP BAR 19 LF $6.00 $114.00 $11.04 $209.76 $16.00 $304.00 $15.00 $285.00

A45 6' WIDE THERMOPLASTIC HI-VIS CROSSWALK 38 LF $6.00 $228.00 $15.52 $589.76 $4.00 $152.00 $45.00 $1,710.00

A46 4" EPOXY STRIPING 429 LF $2.00 $858.00 $2.58 $1,106.82 $2.00 $858.00 $2.00 $858.00

A47 4" DASHED EPOXY STRIPING 96 LF $2.00 $192.00 $2.58 $247.68 $2.00 $192.00 $2.00 $192.00

A48 SIGN W11A-2 CROSSWALK 4 UNIT $350.00 $1,400.00 $258.75 $1,035.00 $150.00 $600.00 $100.00 $400.00

A49 4" THERMOPLASTIC STRIPING 307 LF $2.00 $614.00 $1.84 $564.88 $4.00 $1,228.00 $2.00 $614.00

A50 4" LATEX STRIPING 417 LF $1.00 $417.00 $1.09 $454.53 $1.00 $417.00 $1.00 $417.00

A51 LATEX HANDICAPPED SYMBOL PAVEMENT MARKING 4 UNIT $150.00 $600.00 $23.00 $92.00 $150.00 $600.00 $50.00 $200.00

A52 5" TOPSOIL, SEED, FERT., LIME AND MULCH 690 SY $6.00 $4,140.00 $6.50 $4,485.00 $4.00 $2,760.00 $4.00 $2,760.00

A53 CONTINGENCY 1 LUMP SUM $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

TOTAL BID A $686,193.00 $1,091,294.43 $1,327,519.00 $646,766.00

BID B

B1 MOBILIZATION 1 LUMP SUM $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $300,000.00 $300,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00

B2 SITE CLEARING 1 LUMP SUM $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00

B3 SOIL EROSION AND SEDIMENT CONTROL 1 LUMP SUM $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $6,185.00 $6,185.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00

B4 FLAGMEN 320 HOURS $35.00 $11,200.00 $85.00 $27,200.00 $30.00 $9,600.00 $56.00 $17,920.00

B5 CONES 75 UNIT $25.00 $1,875.00 $20.00 $1,500.00 $1.00 $75.00 $5.00 $375.00

B6 DRUMS 20 UNIT $75.00 $1,500.00 $75.00 $1,500.00 $5.00 $100.00 $1.00 $20.00

B7 BREAKAWAY BARRICADES 5 UNIT $150.00 $750.00 $95.00 $475.00 $25.00 $125.00 $100.00 $500.00

B8 SIGN W20-7A FLAGMAN 4 UNIT $150.00 $600.00 $400.00 $1,600.00 $50.00 $200.00 $50.00 $200.00

B9 24"X18" 100 FEET SUPPLEMENTAL PLATE 4 UNIT $100.00 $400.00 $75.00 $300.00 $9.00 $36.00 $25.00 $100.00

B10 SIGN W20-7B BE PREPARED TO STOP 4 UNIT $150.00 $600.00 $400.00 $1,600.00 $50.00 $200.00 $70.00 $280.00

B11 SIGN G20-2A END ROAD WORK 3 UNIT $150.00 $450.00 $75.00 $225.00 $50.00 $150.00 $70.00 $210.00

B12 SIGN R9-9 SIDEWALK CLOSED 3 UNIT $100.00 $300.00 $50.00 $150.00 $50.00 $150.00 $40.00 $120.00

B13 SIGN W20-4B ROAD WORK 1000 FT 1 UNIT $150.00 $150.00 $400.00 $400.00 $50.00 $50.00 $1.00 $1.00

B14 SIGN W20-4C ROAD WORK 500 FT 1 UNIT $150.00 $150.00 $400.00 $400.00 $50.00 $50.00 $1.00 $1.00

B15 SIGN W20-4 ONE LANE ROAD 800 FT 1 UNIT $150.00 $150.00 $400.00 $400.00 $50.00 $50.00 $80.00 $80.00

B16 TEST PITS (12' AVG. DEPTH) 3 UNIT $500.00 $1,500.00 $100.00 $300.00 $750.00 $2,250.00 $150.00 $450.00

B17 TEMP. STEEL SHEET PILES IF REQUIRED 3000 SF $12.50 $37,500.00 $1.00 $3,000.00 $15.00 $45,000.00 $15.00 $45,000.00

B18 EXCAVATION (UNCLASSIFIED) 1 LUMP SUM $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $28,000.00 $28,000.00 $195,000.00 $195,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00

B19

REINFORCED CONCRETE WALL AND FOOTING INCLUDING 

STONE VENEER, REINF. STEEL AND CAP STONE 350 CY $500.00 $175,000.00 $1,600.00 $560,000.00 $200.00 $70,000.00 $775.00 $271,250.00

B20 4" PERF. HDPE UNDERDRAIN 660 LF $10.00 $6,600.00 $12.00 $7,920.00 $30.00 $19,800.00 $6.00 $3,960.00

B21 3/4" CLEAN CRUSHED STONE FOR UNDERDRAINS 182 CY $30.00 $5,460.00 $33.00 $6,006.00 $35.00 $6,370.00 $80.00 $14,560.00

B22 MIRAFI 140N FILTER FABRIC OR EQUAL 1810 SY $3.00 $5,430.00 $2.00 $3,620.00 $1.00 $1,810.00 $4.00 $7,240.00

B23 TENSAR BX1100 GEOGRID OR EQUAL 265 SY $8.00 $2,120.00 $10.00 $2,650.00 $18.00 $4,770.00 $45.00 $11,925.00

B24 3/8" CLEAN CRUSHED STONE FOUNDATION MATERIAL 100 CY $30.00 $3,000.00 $45.00 $4,500.00 $35.00 $3,500.00 $85.00 $8,500.00

B25

1 1/2" QUARRY BLEND INCLUDING EXCAVATION IF AND 

WHERE DIRECTED 100 CY $30.00 $3,000.00 $48.00 $4,800.00 $30.00 $3,000.00 $70.00 $7,000.00

B26

6" THICK 4500 PSI CONC. SIDEWALK COLORED BROWN INCL. 

FOUNDATION STONE AND WWF 2282 SF $15.00 $34,230.00 $11.50 $26,243.00 $10.00 $22,820.00 $8.00 $18,256.00

B27 HANDICAPPED RAMP DELINEATION 64 SF $100.00 $6,400.00 $35.00 $2,240.00 $34.00 $2,176.00 $28.00 $1,792.00

B28 TYPE ML/CL COMPACTED BACKFILL 110 CY $30.00 $3,300.00 $42.00 $4,620.00 $50.00 $5,500.00 $60.00 $6,600.00

B29 COMPACTED SELECT FILL 600 CY $25.00 $15,000.00 $42.00 $25,200.00 $30.00 $18,000.00 $40.00 $24,000.00

B30 PIPE RAILING WITH HANDRAIL 238 LF $150.00 $35,700.00 $300.00 $71,400.00 $300.00 $71,400.00 $149.00 $35,462.00

B31 PIPE HANDRAIL (ONLY) 208 LF $50.00 $10,400.00 $250.00 $52,000.00 $50.00 $10,400.00 $50.00 $10,400.00

B32 6"X8"X18" 4500 PSI CONC. CURB 188 LF $30.00 $5,640.00 $30.00 $5,640.00 $30.00 $5,640.00 $15.00 $2,820.00

B33 6" COMP. DENSE GRADED AGGREGATE SUBBASE 100 SY $10.00 $1,000.00 $10.00 $1,000.00 $17.00 $1,700.00 $30.00 $3,000.00

B34 4" COMP. BITUMINOUS STAB. BASE MIX I-2 23 TON $75.00 $1,725.00 $250.00 $5,750.00 $150.00 $3,450.00 $200.00 $4,600.00

B35 2" COMP. BIT. CONC. SURFACE COURSE MIX I-5 12 TON $75.00 $900.00 $250.00 $3,000.00 $150.00 $1,800.00 $300.00 $3,600.00

B36 BRICK SIDEWALK 875 SF $30.00 $26,250.00 $17.00 $14,875.00 $20.00 $17,500.00 $24.00 $21,000.00

B37 TOW PATH 11 SY $100.00 $1,100.00 $10.00 $110.00 $80.00 $880.00 $50.00 $550.00

B38 STANDARD W BEAM WEATHERING STEEL GUIDE RAIL 38 LF $100.00 $3,800.00 $100.00 $3,800.00 $62.00 $2,356.00 $171.00 $6,498.00

B39 EXTRUDER TERMINAL 2 UNIT $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00

B40 12' TIMBER GATE WITH 3 POSTS AND HARDWARE 2 UNIT $8,000.00 $16,000.00 $4,700.00 $9,400.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $6,500.00 $13,000.00

B41 HANDICAPPED PARKING SIGNS 4 UNIT $350.00 $1,400.00 $400.00 $1,600.00 $250.00 $1,000.00 $200.00 $800.00

B42 CONCRETE PARKING BUMPER BLOCKS 4 UNIT $200.00 $800.00 $100.00 $400.00 $50.00 $200.00 $40.00 $160.00

B43 RESET INLET GRATE 1 UNIT $250.00 $250.00 $500.00 $500.00 $300.00 $300.00 $100.00 $100.00

B44 24" THERMOPLASTIC STOP BAR 19 LF $6.00 $114.00 $11.04 $209.76 $16.00 $304.00 $15.00 $285.00

B45 6' WIDE THERMOPLASTIC HI-VIS CROSSWALK 38 LF $6.00 $228.00 $15.52 $589.76 $4.00 $152.00 $45.00 $1,710.00

B46 4" EPOXY STRIPING 429 LF $2.00 $858.00 $2.58 $1,106.82 $2.00 $858.00 $2.00 $858.00

B47 4" DASHED EPOXY STRIPING 96 LF $2.00 $192.00 $2.58 $247.68 $2.00 $192.00 $2.00 $192.00

B48 SIGN W11A-2 CROSSWALK 4 UNIT $350.00 $1,400.00 $258.75 $1,035.00 $150.00 $600.00 $100.00 $400.00

B49 4" THERMOPLASTIC STRIPING 307 LF $2.00 $614.00 $1.84 $564.88 $4.00 $1,228.00 $2.00 $614.00

B50 4" LATEX STRIPING 417 LF $1.00 $417.00 $1.09 $454.53 $1.00 $417.00 $1.00 $417.00

B51 LATEX HANDICAPPED SYMBOL PAVEMENT MARKING 4 UNIT $150.00 $600.00 $23.00 $92.00 $150.00 $600.00 $50.00 $200.00

B52 5" TOPSOIL, SEED, FERT., LIME AND MULCH 690 SY $6.00 $4,140.00 $6.50 $4,485.00 $4.00 $2,760.00 $4.00 $2,760.00

B53 CONTINGENCY 1 LUMP SUM $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

TOTAL BID B $496,193.00 $1,081,294.43 $1,069,519.00 $646,766.00

BID SUMMARY SHEET

PREPARED BY

VAN CLEEF ENGINEERING ASSOCIATES

4 AAA DRIVE, SUITE 102, HAMILTON, NJ 08691

No Bid

MUNICIPALITY: HOPEWELL TOWNSHIP        DATE: 10-10-08       TIME: 10:00 AM 

HERBERT J. SEEBURGER, JR.

N.J.P.E. NO. 24GE04748700

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid


